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PALM BEACH POLO & CC | EAST LAKE BUNGALOW | $749,000 | With 
both IPC and the Palm Beach International Equestrian Center close by, this 
newly-renovated home falls nothing short of phenomenal. The property 
is complete with a 1 bedroom/1 bath guest cottage and a 3 bedroom/2.5 
bath main home, in which everything is new, including impact windows and 
doors, custom-built kitchen and cathedral wood ceilings.

AERO CLUB | $1,695,000 | Sleek, stunning, and completely renovated, 
this Aero Club home features 4 bedrooms and 4 full baths. Light and bright 
with vaulted ceilings, wood beams, and an abundance of new impact glass 
windows. Other features include gorgeous wood fl oors, a brand new kitchen 
with gas cooking, and a large chef’s island. Exterior renovations include a 
new roof, new pool, a marble patio area, and a completely fenced spacious 
backyard. This luxurious and well appointed home is located just a short golf 
cart ride from the Wellington Horse Show Grounds. 

AERO CLUB | $1,450,000 | If hopping on a jet in your own backyard sounds 
like a dream come true, it’s time that you make your move to this fabulous, 
beautifully renovated 3 bedroom, 3.5  bathroom home at Wellington Aero 
Club. The property offers the unique opportunity to build your own hangar 
for your jet, and features its own personal taxiway lot. Golf cart distance from 
the world-famous equestrian showgrounds.

OAK TREE VILLAS | PALM BEACH POLO & CC | $439,000 | Spacious 
second fl oor 3 bedroom 3 bath Oak Tree Villa within Palm Beach Polo & 
Country Club. Features extended screened in patio area, golf course views, 
and separate living areas for all to enjoy! The living space boasts an open 
& airy fl oor plan. The home is further enhanced with high ceilings and 
tranquil views of water and the 14th hole of the Dunes golf course. Great for 
entertaining.
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